





Amendment of
seetion 192A.

Amendment of
section 194BB.
Ameandment of

section 194C.

Amendment of
section 194D,

Amendment of

section [94DA,

Amendment of
section 194EE.

Amendment of
section 194G,

Amendment of
section J94H,

Omission of
sections 194K
and 1941,
Amendment of
cection 194LA.

Awmendmen of
section
1941 BA.

Amendment of
cection
1941.BB.

e s meovastent OF redssessment, as the case may be, is less than sixty days,
such r ning period shall be extended to sixty days and the aforesaid period of
limitation shal,  deemed to be extended accordi = y.".

72. In section 192A of the Income-tax Act, in the first proviso. for the words “thirty
wmd rupees”, the words “fifty thousand rupees™ shall be substituted with effect from the
st day of June, 2016.

73. In section 194BB of the Income-tax Act, for the words “five thousand rupees™. the
words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted with effect from the st day of June, 2016.

section 194C of the Tncome-tax Act, in sub-section (5), in the proviso, for the
words ty-tive thousand rupees™. the words “one lakh rupees™ shall be substituted with
effect from the [st day of June, 2016.

_.Insection  Dofthe Income-tax Act. in the second proviso. for the words “twenty
thousand rupees”, the words “fifteen thousand rupees” shall be substituted with effect from
the Ist day of June, 2016.

76. In section [94DA of the Income-tax Act, for the words “two per cent.”. the words
“one per cent.” shall be substituted with effect from the st day of June, 2016.

In section [94EE of the Income-tax Act, for the words “twenty per cenl.”, the
words “ten per cent.” shall be substituted with effect from the Tst day of June, 2016.

78. In section 19 of the Thcome-tax Act, in sub-section (1), with effect trom the
1st day of Junc, 2016,

(1) for the words “one thousand rupees”. the words “fifteen thousand rupees”
shall be subsututed;

(i) for the words “ten per cent.”, the words “five per cent.” shall be substituted.
79. Insection 1 {of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of June. 201¢
(1) for the words “ten per cent.”. the words “five per cent.” shall be substituted,

(if) in first proviso, for the words “five thousand rupees”, the words “fifteen
thousand rupees™ shall be substituted.

80. Section 194K and section . of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect
from the 1st day of June, 2016.

81. In section 194LAof © Tncome-tax Act. in the proviso, for the words “two hundred
thousand rupees™, the words “two lakh and fifty thousand rupees™ shall be substituted with
effect from the st day of June. 2016.

82. Tn scction 194L.BA of the Income-tax Act. with ettect from the st day of June,
2016,—

(/Y in sub-section (/), for the words, brackets, figures and letiers “in clause
(Z3FCY", the words. brackets. figures and letters “in sub-clause («) of clause (23FC)”
shall be substituted;

{if) in sub-section (2). for the words, brackets, figures and letters "in clavse
(23F(C)Y". the words, brackets, figures and letters “in sub-clause («) of clause (23FC)”
shall be substituted.

83. In section BB of the Income-tax Act. for the words “deduct income-tax thereon
at the rate ot ten per cent.”. the following shall be substituted with etfect from the 1st day of
Junc, 2016, namely:—

“deduct income-tax thereon,—

(1) at the rate of ten per cent., where the payee is a resident;



